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SPECIFICATION 11 

PUBLIC INTEREST COMMITMENTS 

1. Registry Operator will use only ICANN accredited registrars that are party to the Registrar 
Accreditation Agreement approved by the ICANN Board of Directors on [date to be determined at time of 
contracting], 2013(or any subsequent form of Registrar Accreditation Agreement approved by the 
ICANN Board of Directors) in registering domain names.  A list of such registrars shall be maintained by 
ICANN on ICANN’s website. 

 

2.  Registry Operator will operate the registry for the TLD in compliance with all commitments, 
statements of intent and business plans stated in the following sections of Registry Operator’s application 
to ICANN for the TLD, which commitments, statements of intent and business plans are hereby 
incorporated by reference into this Agreement.  Registry Operator’s obligations pursuant to this paragraph 
shall be enforceable by ICANN and through the Public Interest Commitment Dispute Resolution Process 
established by ICANN ((posted at [url to be inserted when final procedure is adopted]), as it may be 
amended by ICANN from time to time, the “PICDRP”).  Registry Operator shall comply with the 
PICDRP. Registry Operator agrees to implement and adhere to any remedies ICANN imposes (which 
may include any reasonable remedy, including for the avoidance of doubt, the termination of the Registry 
Agreement pursuant to Section 4.3(e) of the Registry Agreement) following a determination by any 
PICDRP panel and to be bound by any such determination. 
 

- Section 22 
- Section 28 
- Section 29 
 

3. Registry Operator agrees to perform following specific public interest commitments, which 
commitments shall be enforceable by ICANN and through the PICDRP. Registry Operator shall comply 
with the PICDRP. Registry Operator agrees to implement and adhere to any remedies ICANN imposes 
(which may include any reasonable remedy, including for the avoidance of doubt, the termination of the 
Registry Agreement pursuant to Section 4.3(e) of the Registry Agreement) following a determination by 
any PICDRP panel and to be bound by any such determination. 
 

- Restrain from lowering wholesale registration or renewal fees for prices under 25 USD. 
 
According to the Mcafee report, Mapping the Mal Web, one of the primary reasons of choice that drives 
spammers, pirates, etc. towards a domain extension is price.  Registry Operator commits to maintain 
prices over 25 USD at all times for single one year terms of registrations or renewals of domain names.   
 

- Contractually commit the designation of the Compliance Officer as stated in sections 28 and 29 
of the application, and inform ICANN of contact details of the Officer. 
 

As per sections 28 and 29, Registry Operator commits to designate the Compliance Officer and submit 
the contact details of the Officer for ICANN review, and public posting.  Compliance Officer will 
produce a state of health report about the extension as detailed later in this specification 

 
- Contract with a recognized third party for the monitoring of activities of malware distribution and 

unauthorized content distribution in sites under the .LEGAL TLD. 
 
Registry Operator  agrees to maintain an agreement with a recognized third party at all times while the 
Registry Agreement is  for the monitoring of activities related to malware, or unauthorized content 



distribution in sites under the .LEGAL TLD.  Based on the monitoring of the TLD, Registry Operator will 
engage with Registrars for the takedown or cleanse of the compromised sites, or act on its own behalf to 
suspend domains being used for the distribution of malware or unauthorized content.  Such distribution 
will be deemed unauthorized or harmful based on the concept of the third party performing the 
monitoring activity. 

 
- Produce, publish and make available a state of health report for the domain extension with the 

validation and certification of a respectable third party. 
 
Registry Operator agrees to produce a quarterly report on the health of the sites under the .LEGAL 
extension.  The report will include monitoring, data accuracy and compliance cases and will serve as a 
reference for the constant improvement of the TLD. 


